
Software License Agreement  
 

Before using the “Group Controller Series4 PCMONITOR” (hereinafter referred to as “this software”), thoroughly 
read this software license agreement (hereinafter referred to as “this agreement”). By using or installing this 
software wholly or in part, you (hereinafter referred to as the “user”) agree to be bound by the terms of this 
agreement. If you do not agree to the terms of this agreement, do not use or install this software but return this 
software to the dealer.  

 
1. The term “this software”, as used in this agreement, refers to the computer program distributed in the form of a 

recording medium or a file together with this agreement, as well as the related information and data (including 
but not limited to electronic documents). Any information or data that is explicitly indicated not to be included in 
this software is excluded.  

2. Toshiba Carrier Corporation retains the ownership and all intellectual property rights to this software. The user 
may use this software only in accordance with the terms of this agreement and may use it only for the purposes 
specified by Toshiba Carrier Corporation or the purposes agreed on by Toshiba Carrier Corporation and the 
user.  

3. The copyright to this software belongs to Toshiba Carrier Corporation. This software is protected by laws and 
regulations related to copyright and international treaties.  

4. The user may reproduce and install this software for the purposes mentioned in the documents related to this 
software. The user shall discard copies of this software created by the user immediately if they are no longer 
necessary. Except in the case above, the user may not reproduce this software.  

5. The user may not reverse engineer, decompile, disassemble, or alter this software.  

6. The user may not place this software in such a state in which it can be used by multiple users through a 
computer network or the Internet.  

7. The user may not distribute, transfer, lend, lease, or sell this software or the license to any person, and may not 
sublicense this software to any person.  

8. The user shall respect the intellectual property rights to this software. The user shall acknowledge that this 
software is confidential information and shall agree to preventing this software from disclosure to a third party.  

9. The user shall abide by the “Foreign Exchange and Foreign Trade Act” and the applicable laws and regulations 
related to export control. The user shall also abide by the US export control law and code of practice, as well as 
the export-related laws and regulations of all related countries. Read through this software license agreement 
and agree to the terms of the agreement before using this application.  

 
10. This software is licensed “as is”, with no warranty expressed or implied. Toshiba Carrier Corporation also 

disclaims any implied guarantee of merchantability or fitness for a particular purpose. Toshiba Carrier 
Corporation shall assume no guarantee or liability for the quality and performance of this software. Toshiba 
Carrier Corporation shall assume no liability for any damage, loss, obligation, or cost caused to the user in 
connection with or as a result of the use of this software.  

11. If the user violates any of the provisions of this agreement or if the user cancels this agreement, the user shall 
immediately uninstall and discard this software and/or return the recording medium and file of this software 
(including any reproductions left on hand) to Toshiba Carrier Corporation.  

12. Toshiba Carrier Corporation reserves the right to request the user to stop the use of this software at any time 
by issuing a notice to the user. Toshiba Carrier Corporation also reserves the right to modify or improve this 
software at any time.  

13. This agreement is governed by the laws of Japan (expect rules for selecting applicable law) and shall be 
construed in accordance with the laws of Japan.  

14. Devices using this software cannot be connected to the Internet. Never connect it to the Internet. We shall 
assume no liability for any problems caused by connecting it to the Internet. It can be connected only to a local 
area network.  



 
-End of agreement- 


