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Carrier Signs Sponsorship Agreement 

with Toyo University Rugby Club 
 
 
TOKYO, July 3, 2025 – Carrier Japan announced a new sponsorship agreement with Toyo 
University Rugby Club. As a part of this sponsorship, the Carrier logo will be prominently featured 
on the team’s practice jerseys, symbolizing the company’s support for athletics and community 
engagement. Carrier Japan is a part of Carrier Global Corporation (NYSE: CARR), global leader in 
intelligent climate and energy solutions. 
 
Established in 1958, the Toyo University Rugby Club boasts a rich and illustrious history, 
underscored by a commitment to excellence both on and off the field. The team recently celebrated 
its best season, finishing as runner-up in the Kanto University Rugby League and earned a spot in 
the All-Japan University Rugby Championship, an annual national tournament to determine the top 
collegiate rugby team in the country. Known for its grit, sportsmanship, and unity, the club has 
inspired fans and exemplified great teamwork. This sponsorship highlights Carrier Japan’s ongoing 
commitment to investing in the local community and supporting the well-being and development of 
future generations. Carrier Japan values the health and well-being of its employees and 
stakeholders, and this collaboration with the Toyo University Rugby Club is a testament to those 
principles. 
 
“Everyone on our team is giving their best whether in practice or on the field - under our seasonal 
slogan Navy Warriors,” said Club Captain Stefan Vahafolau. “We are truly grateful for Carrier Japan’s 
generous support and are determined to reach even greater heights together.” 
 
“We see tremendous potential in Toyo University Rugby Club, whose roster includes players from 
12 different countries. We also feel a strong affinity with the team, as its school color, resembles our 
corporate color,” said Toru Kubo, President of Carrier Japan. “We are honored to support the ‘Navy 
Warriors’ as they pursue their goals with unwavering dedication and hope this sponsorship will serve 
as a meaningful contribution to the development of young athletes who lead the next generation.”  
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About Carrier Japan 
Carrier Japan provides sustainable solutions integrating energy efficient products for residential, 
light commercial and industrial customers. Carrier Japan is a part of Carrier Global Corporation 
(NYSE: CARR), global leader in intelligent climate and energy solutions, committed to creating 
innovations that bring comfort, safety and sustainability to life. For more information, visit Carrier 
Climate Solutions Asia Pacific, Middle East & Africa.  
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